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Section 
1 Service Materials and NO LEAD Brass No Bid

Meter Gasket, rubber 3/4" x 1/8" 3500 0.07 245 0.18 630 0.06 210 0.1 350 No Bid

Meter Gasket, rubber 1" x 1/8" 300 0.08 24 0.19 57 0.07 21 0.12 36 No Bid

Meter Gasket, rubber 1.5" 10 0.7 7 1.3 13 0.62 6.2 0.93 9.30 No Bid

Meter Gasket, rubber 2" 40 0.75 30 1.75 70 0.73 29.2 1.1 44 No Bid

Meter Gasket Kit, 2" (#431TO8PLF water 
meter flange, oval) 35 51.03 1786.05 65 2275 52.69 1844.15 58.86 2060.1 No Bid

Meter Coupling with gasket, 3/4" 250 4.38 1095 7.05 1762.5 4.5 1125 7.5 1875 No Bid

Meter coupling with gasket, 1" 15 5.73 85.95 10.5 157.5 5.89 88.35 11.54 173.1 No Bid

Curb stop with lockwing, comp/iron, 3/4" 100 31.36 3136 35.25 3525 31.05 3105 48.9 4890 No Bid

Curb stop with lockwing, comp/iron, 1" 30 55.89 1676.7 61 1830 55.33 1659.9 74.18 2225.4 No Bid

Curb stop with lockwing, comp/iron, 2" 20 198.99 3979.8 240.9 4818 211.97 4239.4 221.42 4428.4 No Bid

Curb stop with lockwing, iron/iron, 3/4" 30 26.49 794.7 29.85 895.5 26.23 786.9 27.4 822 No Bid

Curb stop with lockwing, iron/iron, 1" 15 46.76 701.4 52.55 788.25 46.29 694.35 66.65 999.75 No Bid

Curb stop w/meter swivel nut, 1" x 3/4" 
(#B43-342W-NL) 130 58.56 7612.8 65 8450 57.97 7536.1 62.36 8106.8 No Bid

Corporation, cc/compression, 3/4" 2 25.69 51.38 28.5 57 25.44 50.88 26.54 53.08 No Bid

Corporation, cc/compression, 1" 100 38.85 3885 43.25 4325 38.46 3846 40.15 4015 No Bid

Corporation, cc/compression, 2" 15 185.32 2779.8 201.75 3026.25 183.42 2751.3 191.45 2871.75 No Bid

Tapping bushing, cc thread, 3/4" x 1" 70 9.89 692.3 10.85 759.5 9.8 686 9.97 697.9 No Bid

3 part union, comp/comp 3/4" x 3" 140 14.34 2007.6 15.95 2233 14.21 1989.4 14.43 2020.2 No Bid

3 part union, comp/comp 1" 170 16.39 2786.3 18.25 3102.5 16.24 2760.8 16.95 2881.5 No Bid

3 part union, comp/comp, 3/4" x 1" 80 16.65 1332 18.55 1484 16.49 1319.2 17.22 1377.6 No Bid

3 part union, comp/comp, 2" 25 74.13 1853.25 78.15 1953.75 73.38 1834.5 76.59 1914.75 No Bid

Adapter, male, comp/iron, 3/4" 20 11.77 235.4 13.15 263 11.66 233.2 12.17 243.4 No Bid

Adptor, male, comp/iron, 1" 10 13.94 139.4 15.5 155 13.81 138.1 14.42 144.2 No Bid

Adaptor, male, comp/iron, 2" 10 55.69 556.9 61 610 55.12 551.2 57.53 575.3 No Bid

Adaptor, female, comp/iron, 3/4" 10 12.39 123.9 13.75 137.5 12.27 122.7 12.79 127.9 No Bid

Adaptor, female, comp/iron, 1" 10 16.8 168 18.7 187 16.64 166.4 17.36 173.6 No Bid

Adptor, female, comp/iron, 1.5" 2 48.87 97.74 57 114 48.38 96.76 50.51 101.02 No Bid

Adptor, female, comp/iron, 2" 12 58.21 698.52 63.35 760.2 57.62 691.44 60.13 721.56 No Bid
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Gave valve, brass, 3/4" 2 5.56 11.12 6.75 13.5 5.75 11.5 7.85 15.7 No Bid

Gate valve, brass, 1" 2 8.36 16.72 10.05 20.1 8.65 17.3 11.67 23.34 No Bid

Gate valve, brass, 1.5" 2 14.99 29.98 18.05 36.1 15.49 30.98 24.63 49.26 No Bid

Gate valve, bass, 2" 10 24.98 249.8 30 300 25.81 258.1 36.3 363 No Bid
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1 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
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Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Meter riser w/lockwing, 7" x 3/4" 10 72.78 727.8 82.5 825 72.04 720.4 78.29 782.9 No Bid

Meter riser w/lockwing, 9" x 3/4" 2 73.68 147.36 85.35 170.7 72.94 145.88 79.2 158.4 No Bid
U-branch w/lockwing, 6 1/2" centers, 3/4" 
x 1" 100 94.57 9457 100.15 10015 93.61 9361 98.6 9860 No Bid

Collar, brass, 3/4" 10 2.86 28.6 3.4 34 2.95 29.5 2.83 28.3 No Bid

Ell, brass, 90 DEGREE, 3/4" 2 3.25 6.5 4.25 8.5 3.65 7.3 3.5 7 No Bid

Ell, brass, 90 degree, 1" 6 5.02 30.12 6.5 39 5.63 33.78 5.39 32.34 No Bid

Ell, brass, 90 degree, 2" 4 17.61 70.44 21.15 84.6 18.19 72.76 17.44 69.76 No Bid

Tee, brass, iron/iron, 3/4" x 3/4" 4 4.34 17.36 5.25 21 4.48 17.92 4.3 17.2 No Bid

Bushing, brass, 3/4" x 1" 10 2.85 28.5 3.45 34.5 2.95 29.5 2.83 28.3 No Bid

Bushing, brass, 3/4" x 1 1/4" 1 4.87 4.87 5.85 5.85 5.03 5.03 4.82 4.82 No Bid

Bushing, brass, 1" x 2" 10 11.1 111 13.35 133.5 11.47 114.7 11 110 No Bid

Bushing, brass, 1 1/2" x 2" 4 9.22 36.88 11.05 44.2 9.52 38.08 9.13 36.52 No Bid

Nipple, close all thread, 3/4" 10 1.6 16 1.95 19.5 1.65 16.5 1.58 15.8 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 3/4" x 2" 10 2.01 20.1 2.45 24.5 2.08 20.8 1.99 19.9 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 3/4" x 4" 10 3.5 35 4.2 42 3.62 36.2 3.47 34.7 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 3/4" x 6" 10 5.12 51.2 6.15 61.5 5.29 52.9 5.07 50.7 No Bid

Nipple, close all thread, 1" 10 2.35 23.5 2.85 28.5 2.43 24.3 2.33 23.3 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 1/2" 5 1.11 5.55 1.35 6.75 1.14 5.7 1.1 5.5 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 1" x 2" 8 2.89 23.12 3.45 27.6 3 24 2.88 23.04 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 1" x 4" 5 5.07 25.35 6.1 30.5 5.25 26.25 5.03 25.15 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 1" x 6" 8 7.48 59.84 9 72 7.73 61.84 7.41 59.28 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 1 1/2" x 4" 2 8.91 17.82 10.65 21.3 9.2 18.4 8.82 17.64 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 1 1/2" x 6" 10 13.16 131.6 15.8 158 13.6 136 13.04 130.4 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 2" x 2" 5 7.03 35.15 8.45 42.25 7.26 36.3 6.95 34.75 No Bid

Niple, brass, 2" x 4" 20 11.46 229.2 13.75 275 11.84 236.8 11.35 227 No Bid

Nipple, brass, 2" x 6" 30 16.93 507.9 20.3 609 17.48 524.4 16.76 502.8 No Bid
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Reducer, 2" x 3/4" 10 19.51 195.1 23.45 234.5 20.15 201.5 19.31 193.1 No Bid

Reducer, 2" x 1" bushing 10 19.51 195.1 23.45 234.5 20.15 201.5 19.31 193.1 No Bid

Reducer, brass, 2" x 1.5" bushing 10 17.31 173.1 20.75 207.5 17.88 178.8 17.14 171.4 No Bid

Plug, brass, 1" 10 2.72 27.2 3.25 32.5 2.81 28.1 2.7 27 No Bid

Plug, brass, 3/4" 5 2.08 10.4 2.45 12.25 2.13 10.65 2.05 10.25 No Bid

Tee, brass, 1" x 1" 5 7.71 38.55 9.25 46.25 7.97 39.85 7.64 38.2 No Bid

Tee, brass, 2" x 2" 2 24.39 48.78 29.25 58.5 25.18 50.36 24.15 48.3 No Bid
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1 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
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Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Collar, brass, 1.5" 2 9.22 18.44 11.05 22.1 9.52 19.04 9.13 18.26 No Bid

Collar, brass, 1" 2 4.33 8.66 5.25 10.5 4.48 8.96 4.3 8.6 No Bid

Collar, brass, 2" 10 15.18 151.8 18.25 182.5 15.67 156.7 15.03 150.3 No Bid

Tapping saddle, PVC 351, 2" x 1" 20 20.47 409.4 22 440 20.74 414.8 22.4 448 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 3" x 1" 5 20.77 103.85 23 115 21.26 106.3 38.21 191.05 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 4" x 1" 40 21.26 850.4 24 960 22.74 909.6 22.6 904 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 4" x 2" 2 25.73 51.46 30 60 28.39 56.78 28.21 56.42 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 6" x 1" 50 24.25 1212.5 28 1400 26.47 1323.5 26.29 1314.5 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 8" x 1" 10 28.89 288.9 33 330 31.42 314.2 31.22 312.2 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 12" x 1" 4 36.57 146.28 42 168 39.7 158.8 39.46 157.84 No Bid

Tapping, saddle, AC 315, 6" x 2" 10 28.78 287.8 33 330 31.02 310.2 30.81 308.1 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 8" x 2" 1 34.12 34.12 39 39 37.33 37.33 37.1 37.1 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 10" x 2" 10 40.07 400.7 44 440 41.94 419.4 41.67 416.7 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 12" x 2" 2 46.72 93.44 51 102 48.74 97.48 49.72 99.44 No Bid

Tapping saddle, AC 315, 16" x 2" 2 99.98 199.96 110 220 105.75 211.5 110.35 220.7 No Bid

Sub Total - All items, Section 1 $55,683.21 $63,288.50 $55,952.90 62,019.97$    

Section 
2 Clamps and Couplings - Smith Blair 244 Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric
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Unit 
Price
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Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Redi clamp, 3/4" x 3" 15 NO BID 22 330 19.01 285.15 19.21 288.15 No Bid

Redi clamp, 3/4" x 6" 5 NO BID 45 225 40.19 200.95 40.6 203 No Bid

Redi clamp, 1" x 3" 10 NO BID 23 230 20.11 201.1 20.32 203.2 No Bid

Redi clamp, 1" x 6" 5 NO BID 46 230 40.48 202.4 40.91 204.55 No Bid
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Redi clamp, 1 1/4" x 3" 5 NO BID 24 120 20.49 102.45 20.71 103.55 No Bid

Redi clamp, 1 1/4" x 6" 2 NO BID 47 94 40.98 81.96 41.41 82.82 No Bid

Redi clamp, 1 1/2" x 3" 5 NO BID 24 120 21.18 105.9 21.4 107 No Bid

Redi clamp, 1 1/2" x 6" 2 NO BID 48 96 41.77 83.54 42.21 84.42 No Bid

Clamps and Couplings - Smith Blair 245 NO BID 0 No Bid

Redi clamp, 2" x 3" 10 NO BID 10 100 7.29 72.9 7.36 73.6 No Bid

Redi Clamp, 2" x 6" 10 NO BID 18 180 13.21 132.1 13.34 133.4 No Bid

Clamps and Couplings - Smith Blair 226 NO BID 0 No Bid

FCC 2.35 - 2.63 x 7.5" 70 NO BID 34 2380 42.16 2951.2 42.6 2982 No Bid

FCC 2.35 - 2.63 x 12" 10 NO BID 57 570 74.85 748.5 75.63 756.3 No Bid

FCC 3.46 - 3.70 x 12" 2 NO BID 69 138 83.13 166.26 84 168 No Bid
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2 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric
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Price
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FCC 3.73 - 4.00 x 12" 1 NO BID 69 69 85.55 85.55 86.44 86.44 No Bid

FCC 3.96 - 4.25 x 7.5" 35 NO BID 43 1505 53.16 1860.6 53.72 1880.2 No Bid

FCC 3.96 - 4.25 x 12" 5 NO BID 73 365 90.31 451.55 91.33 456.65 No Bid

FCC 4.45 - 4.73 x 7.5" 2 NO BID 45 90 55.03 110.06 55.6 111.2 No Bid

FCC 4.45 - 4.73 x 12" 2 NO BID 75 150 92.92 185.84 93.89 187.78 No Bid

FCC 4.74 - 5.14 x 7.5" 10 NO BID 45 450 56.96 569.6 57.55 575.5 No Bid

FCC 4.74 - 5.14 x 12" 2 NO BID 75 150 93.35 186.7 94.32 188.64 No Bid

FCC 4.95 - 5.35 x 7.5" 15 NO BID 45 675 57.57 863.55 58.17 872.55 No Bid

FCC 4.95 - 5.35 x 12" 2 NO BID 75 150 98.26 196.52 99.28 198.56 No Bid

FCC 6.56 - 6.96 x 7.5" 5 NO BID 53 265 65.77 328.85 66.46 332.3 No Bid

FCC 6.56 - 6.96 x 12" 1 NO BID 84 84 105.97 105.97 107.07 107.07 No Bid

FCC 6.84 - 7.24 x 7.5" 10 NO BID 53 530 67.23 672.3 67.93 679.3 No Bid

FCC 6.84 - 7.24 x 12" 10 NO BID 84 840 107.53 1075.3 108.65 1086.5 No Bid

FCC 7.05 - 7.45 x 7.5" 20 NO BID 53 1060 68.24 1364.8 68.95 1379 No Bid

FCc 7.05 - 7.45 x 12" 10 NO BID 84 840 109.28 1092.8 110.42 1104.2 No Bid

FCC 7.45 - 7.85 x 7.5" 1 NO BID 53 53 69.99 69.99 70.72 70.72 No Bid

FCC 8.54 - 8.94 x 7.5" 1 NO BID 81 81 77.94 77.94 106.04 106.04 No Bid

FCC 8.99 - 9.39 x 7.5" 5 NO BID 62 310 80.42 402.1 81.26 406.3 No Bid

FCC 8.99 - 9.39 x 12" 2 NO BID 98 196 128.77 257.54 130.11 260.22 No Bid
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FCC 9.27 - 9.67 x 7.5" 10 NO BID 62 620 82.2 822 83.05 830.5 No Bid

FCC 9.27 - 9.67 x 12" 10 NO BID 98 980 131.61 1316.1 132.98 1329.8 No Bid

FCC 11.75 - 12.15 x 7.5" 2 NO BID 81 162 99.96 199.92 101 202 No Bid

FCC 13.40 - 13.80 x 15" 1 NO BID 151 151 223.94 223.94 226.24 226.24 No Bid

FCC 14.00 - 14.40 x 12.5" 2 NO BID 146 292 185.36 370.72 187.29 374.58 No Bid

FCC 14.38 - 15.13 x 12" 1 NO BID 302 302 421.08 421.08 425.47 425.47 No Bid

FCC 18.46 - 19.20 x 16" 2 NO BID 375 750 476.55 953.1 481.51 963.02 No Bid

FCC 11.04 - 11.44 x 7.5" 2 NO BID 81 162 97.89 195.78 98.39 196.78 No Bid

Dresser Couplings Smith Blair 411 Quantit Unit Pric
Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Dresser coupling, 3/4" 7 NO BID 20 140 19.45 136.15 19.66 137.62 No Bid

Dreser coupling, 1" 24 NO BID 21 504 20.12 482.88 20.33 487.92 No Bid

Dresser coupling, 1 1/4" 2 NO BID 22 44 21.07 42.14 21.29 42.58 No Bid

Dresser coupling, 1 1/2" 10 NO BID 25 250 25.16 251.6 25.43 254.3 No Bid

Dresser coupling, 2" 20 NO BID 30 600 28.51 570.2 28.8 576 No Bid
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Coupling, 4" top bolt (4.46-5.60) 6 NO BID 150 900 137.13 822.78 143.41 860.46 No Bid

Coupling, 6" top bolt (6.56-7.60) 6 NO BID 210 1260 181.07 1086.42 189.94 1139.64 No Bid

Coupling, 8" top bolt (8.54-9.85) 6 NO BID 225 1350 205.06 1230.36 214.44 1286.64 No Bid

Coupling, 12" top bolt (6.21-3.67) 2 NO BID 425 850 318.82 637.64 325.61 651.22 No Bid

Sub Total, All Items Section 2 NO BID $21,993.00 $25,054.78 25,463.93$    No Bid
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3
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Unit 
Price
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Fernco No Bid

Adaptor, 4" PVC x 4" PVC 60 3.61 216.6 4.05 243 3.62 217.2 3.67 220.2 No Bid

Adaptor, 4" PVC x 4" Clay 10 3.61 36.1 4.05 40.5 3.62 36.2 3.67 36.7 No Bid

Adaptor, 4" PVC x 4" concrete 10 3.9 39 4.25 42.5 3.9 39 3.96 39.6 No Bid

Adaptor, 6" PVC x 6" PVC 4 7.72 30.88 8.15 32.6 7.73 30.92 7.84 31.36 No Bid

Adaptor, 6" PVC x 6" clay 4 7.72 30.88 8.15 32.6 7.73 30.92 7.84 31.36 No Bid

Adaptor, 6" PVC x 6" concrete 3 8.55 25.65 8.95 26.85 8.55 25.65 8.67 26.01 No Bid

Adaptor, 8" PVC x 8" PVC 5 11.89 59.45 12.65 63.25 11.89 59.45 12.06 60.3 No Bid
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Adaptor, 8" PVC x 8" clay 30 11.89 356.7 12.65 379.5 11.89 356.7 13.03 390.9 No Bid

Adaptor, 8" PVC x 8" concrete 5 12.84 64.2 13.05 65.25 12.85 64.25 13.03 65.15 No Bid

Adaptor, 10" PVC x 10" PVC 2 17.85 35.7 18.5 37 17.86 35.72 18.11 36.22 No Bid

Adaptor, 10" PVC x 10" clay 2 17.85 35.7 18.5 37 17.86 35.72 18.11 36.22 No Bid

Adaptor, 10" PVC concrete 2 17.85 35.7 18.5 37 17.86 35.72 18.11 36.22 No Bid

Apaptor, 12" PVC x 12" clay 2 20.84 41.68 22.5 45 20.84 41.68 21.13 42.26 No Bid

Adaptor, 12" PVC x 12" concrete 2 20.84 41.68 22.5 45 20.84 41.68 21.13 42.26 No Bid

Adaptor, 15" PVC x 15" clay 2 35.28 70.56 35 70 35.28 70.56 36.24 72.48 No Bid

Adptor, 6" clay x 4" PVC 2 9.07 18.14 9.25 18.5 9.08 18.16 9.21 18.42 No Bid

Adaptor, 6" concrete x 4" PVC 2 9.07 18.14 9.25 18.5 9.08 18.16 9.21 18.42 No Bid

Adaptor, 6" clay x 6" I.I. Eccentric 2 50.93 101.86 51 102 50.94 101.88 51.21 102.42 No Bid

Adaptor, 6" concrete x 6" C.I. Eccentric 2 50.93 101.86 51 102 50.94 101.88 51.21 102.42 No Bid

Adaptor, 8" clay x 8" C.I. Eccentric 2 78.54 157.08 80 160 78.54 157.08 78.95 157.9 No Bid

Adaptor, 8" concrete x 8" C.I. Eccentric 2 104.62 209.24 115 230 104.61 209.22 105.16 210.32 No Bid

Coupling, 4" x 4" 70 1.11 77.7 1.75 122.5 1.67 116.9 1.67 116.9 No Bid

Coupling, 6" x 6" 5 6.1 30.5 6.5 32.5 6.11 30.55 6.11 30.55 No Bid

Coupling, 8" x 8" 5 19.03 95.15 20 100 19.04 95.2 19.04 95.2 No Bid

Reducer, 6" x 4", Sch 35 20 8.12 162.4 9 180 8.13 162.6 8.13 162.6 No Bid

Reducer, 8" x 6", Sch 35 10 34.38 343.8 37.5 375 34.39 343.9 34.39 343.9 No Bid

Section 
3 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Ell, 45 degree, 6" 10 9.94 99.4 10.25 102.5 9.95 99.5 9.95 99.5 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 6" 2 10.8 21.6 12 24 10.81 21.62 10.81 21.62 No Bid

Ell, 45 degree, 8" 2 27.16 54.32 30 60 27.17 54.34 27.17 54.34 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 8" 2 38.36 76.72 40 80 38.37 76.74 38.37 76.74 No Bid

Clean-out, 6" with plug 10 25.86 258.6 35 350 25.87 258.7 26.44 264.4 No Bid

Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 6" x 4" 20 19.72 394.4 20 400 19.72 394.4 19.72 394.4 No Bid

Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 6" x 6" 2 32.18 64.36 25 50 NA 25.85 51.7 No Bid

Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 8" x 4" 40 24.76 990.4 25 1000 24.78 991.2 24.78 991.2 No Bid

Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 8" x 6" 2 28.38 56.76 30 60 28.38 56.76 28.38 56.76 No Bid

Saddle tee w/S bands, gaskets, 10" x 4" 10 43.79 437.9 45 450 43.8 438 43.8 438 No Bid

Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 10" x 6" 2 52.3 104.6 56 112 52.3 104.6 52.3 104.6 No Bid

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Fernco

Plastic Trends

Section Continued on Next Page Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Fernco

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 



Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 12" x 4" 4 54.33 217.32 58 232 54.33 217.32 54.33 217.32 No Bid

Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 12" x 6" 2 61.08 122.16 65 130 61.1 122.2 61.1 122.2 No Bid

Saddle tee w/SS bands, gaskets, 15" x 4" 2 57.43 114.86 63 126 57.44 114.88 57.44 114.88 No Bid

Saddle, universal, 6" 6 44.94 269.64 50 300 44.95 269.7 52.24 313.44 No Bid

Saddle, Uuniversal, 4" 70 34.01 2380.7 35 2450 34.02 2381.4 40.08 2805.6 No Bid

Double "Y", 6" x 4" 1 26.89 26.89 32 32 26.9 26.9 26.9 26.9 No Bid

Double "Y", 8" x 4" 1 66.85 66.85 75 75 66.85 66.85 66.85 66.85 No Bid

Tee, Sch 35, 8" x 6" 2 37.52 75.04 42 84 37.52 75.04 37.52 75.04 No Bid

Tee, Sch 35, 6" x 4" 2 13.56 27.12 16 32 13.56 27.12 13.56 27.12 No Bid

Tee, Sch 35, 6" 2 14.35 28.7 17.5 35 14.35 28.7 14.35 28.7 No Bid

Straps, SS w/flip-up screw 200 3.22 644 4.05 810 3.22 644 3.22 644 No Bid

Coupling, 4" 100 2.5 250 2.8 280 2.55 255 2.55 255 No Bid

Ell, 16 degree, 4" 55 4.24 233.2 4.85 266.75 4.31 237.05 4.31 237.05 No Bid

Ell, 45 degree, 4" 70 4.96 347.2 5.15 360.5 5.07 354.9 5.07 354.9 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 4" 55 6.01 330.55 11.05 607.75 11.05 607.75 11.05 607.75 No Bid

Slip cap, 1/2" 30 0.12 3.6 0.25 7.5 0.12 3.6 0.14 4.2 No Bid

Slip cap, 3/4" 30 0.15 4.5 0.28 8.4 0.14 4.2 0.16 4.8 No Bid

Slip cap, 1" 30 0.23 6.9 0.35 10.5 0.22 6.6 0.25 7.5 No Bid

Slip cap, 4" 80 3.26 260.8 3.8 304 3.26 260.8 3.26 260.8 No Bid

Tee, 4" x 4" x 4" 40 8.17 326.8 15.05 602 14.88 595.2 14.88 595.2 No Bid

Cleanout with plug, 4" 120 6.15 738 8.75 1050 5.18 621.6 6.16 739.2 No Bid

Plug only, 4" 40 1.66 66.4 1.95 78 1.67 66.8 1.67 66.8 No Bid

Section 
3 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Double "Y", 4" x 4" 2 22.6 45.2 28 56 22.6 45.2 27.06 54.12 No Bid

Glue, PVC, quart can, Wet and Dry 40 9.86 394.4 14 560 7.39 295.6 17.83 713.2 No Bid

Primer, PVC, quart can 40 5.28 211.2 11.25 450 5.11 204.4 12.14 485.6 No Bid

Lubricant, PVC, quart can 15 3.89 58.35 5.5 82.5 3.39 50.85 3.82 57.3 No Bid

Cement, Talcote, Roof 10 50.58 505.8 60 600 5.79 57.9 75.69 756.9 No Bid

Strips, Ramneck 180 1.88 338.4 3.5 630 1.27 228.6 2.47 444.6 No Bid

Tee, Sch 40, 6" x 4" 10 36.27 362.7 37.5 375 36.27 362.7 38.61 386.1 No Bid
CTS service tubing, 200 PSI, 3/4", 100 ft 
roll 1000 0.21 210 0.22 220 0.18 180 0.2 200 No Bid

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Charlotte/Lasco

Charlotte/Lasco

Charlotte/Lasco

Charlotte/Lasco

Spears/Lasco

Spears/Lasco

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Spears/Lasco

Spears/Lasco

Spears/Lasco

Spears/Lasco

Spears/Lasco

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Plastic Trends

Fernco

Fernco

Section Continued on Next Page

Charlotte/Lasco

Oatey

Rectorseal

Oatey

Evergrip

Evergrip

Spears/Lasco

ADS

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 



CTS service tubing, 200 PSI 1", 100 ft roll 2000 0.29 580 0.4 800 0.31 620 0.34 680 No Bid

CTS service tubing, 200 PSI, 2", 100 ft roll 1000 1.08 1080 1.2 1200 1.01 1010 1.11 1110 No Bid

Meter box, plastic, single with lid 120 12.78 1533.6 14.25 1710 13.97 1676.4 14.26 1711.2 No Bid

Meter box, plastic, dual with lid 10 13.6 136 14.25 142.5 13.97 139.7 14.26 142.6 No Bid

Lid, plastic single 10 7.06 70.6 7.5 75 5.77 57.7 5.89 58.9 No Bid

Meter box, commercial jumbo with lid 60 24.28 1456.8 26.5 1590 25.36 1521.6 25.89 1553.4 No Bid

Pump, hand, 6 ft hose 30 25.06 751.8 30 900 22.9 687 24.71 741.3 No Bid

Sub Total, All Items, Section 3 $19,271.49 $22,598.95 $19,098.02 $21,750.02

Section 
4

Gate Valves w/gland restraings (East 
Jordan or Mueller) Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

CI screw type, 2" 10 224.06 2240.6 215 2150 215.51 2155.1 221.67 2216.7 145 1450

MJ type, 4" 5 410.66 2053.3 410 2050 406.72 2033.6 356.39 1781.95 386 1930

MJ type, 6" 10 499.04 4990.4 504 5040 517.95 5179.5 455 4550 502 5020

MJ type, 8" 2 809.02 1618.04 775 1550 807.98 1615.96 724.04 1448.08 1234 2468

Sub Total, All items, Section 4 $10,902.34 $10,790.00 $10,984.16 $9,996.73 ########

Section 
5

Ductile fittings w/gland restraints & cast 
iron fittings, miscellaneous Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Ell, 45 degree, 4" 2 100.71 201.42 95 190 77.79 155.58 76.06 152.12 No Bid

Ell, 45 degree, 6" 1 137.43 137.43 130 130 106.08 106.08 113.96 113.96 No Bid

Ell, 45 degree, 8" 2 190.88 381.76 182 364 147.44 294.88 144.17 288.34 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 4" 2 107.54 215.08 102 204 83.07 166.14 81.23 162.46 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 6" 2 148.96 297.92 143 286 115.07 230.14 112.52 225.04 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 8" 2 207.54 415.08 199 398 160.31 320.62 156.75 313.5 No Bid

Solid sleeve, 4" x 7.5" 2 92.71 185.42 88 176 71.86 143.72 70.26 140.52 No Bid

Solid Sleeve, 4" x 12" 2 103.27 206.54 98 196 79.77 159.54 78 156 No Bid

Section 
5 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Solid sleeve, 6" x 7.5" 3 129.31 387.93 123 369 99.9 299.7 97.68 293.04 No Bid

Solid sleeve, 6" x 12" 1 143.4 143.4 137 137 110.78 110.78 108.32 108.32 No Bid

Solid sleeve, 8" x 7.5" 2 172.1 344.2 164 328 132.93 265.86 129.98 259.96 No Bid

Solid sleeve, 8" x 12" 3 208.82 626.46 200 600 161.3 483.9 157.72 473.16 No Bid

J&S Valve

J&S Valve

J&S Valve

J&S Valve

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

NDS

NDS

NDS

Beckson

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

ADS

ADS

NDS

East Jordan

East Jordan

East Jordan

East Jordan

Serampore, Ind.

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)
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(if other than 

specified)

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 

AFC

AFC

AFC

AFC

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 



Solid sleeve, 12" x 7.5" 2 326.04 652.08 311 622 251.86 503.72 210.06 420.12 No Bid

Solid sleeve, 12" x 12" 2 361.49 722.98 346 692 279.24 558.48 236.84 473.68 No Bid

Plug, 4" 2 52.27 104.54 18.5 37 40.38 80.76 41.74 83.48 No Bid

Plug w/2" tap, 4" 2 67.22 134.44 34 68 51.93 103.86 50.77 101.54 No Bid

Plug, 6" 2 76.82 153.64 35 70 59.35 118.7 58.03 116.06 No Bid

Plug, w/2" tap, 6" 2 91.34 182.68 50 100 70.57 141.14 69 138 No Bid

Plug 8" 2 108.24 216.48 52 104 83.62 167.24 81.76 163.52 No Bid

Plug w/2" tap, 8" 2 123.19 246.38 68 136 95.16 190.32 93.05 186.1 No Bid

Tee, 4" x 4" 2 154.24 308.48 147 294 119.16 238.32 116.52 233.04 No Bid

Tee, 6" x 4" 2 205.07 410.14 196 392 158.42 316.84 154.9 309.8 No Bid

Tee, 6" x 6" 2 220.24 440.48 210 420 170.13 340.26 166.35 332.7 No Bid

Tee, 8" x 4" 2 249.11 498.22 242 484 192.44 384.88 188.17 376.34 No Bid

Tee, 8" x 6" 2 272.4 544.8 260 520 210.42 420.84 205.75 411.5 No Bid

Tee, 8" x 8" 2 310.64 621.28 298 596 239.97 479.94 234.65 469.3 No Bid

Tee, 12" x 6" 2 439.6 879.2 421 842 339.58 679.16 328.28 656.56 No Bid

Tee, 12" x 8" 2 482.55 965.1 463 926 376.64 753.28 200.22 400.44 No Bid

Reduser, MJSEB x PE, 4" x 3" 2 62.19 124.38 60 120 48.04 96.08 44.15 88.3 No Bid

Reducer, MJSEB x PE, 6" x 3" 2 83.54 167.08 81 162 64.54 129.08 58.67 117.34 No Bid

Reducer, MJSEB x PE, 6" x 4" 2 71.9 143.8 69 138 55.56 111.12 51.1 102.2 No Bid

Reducer, MJSEB x PE, 8" x 4" 2 97.1 194.2 94 188 75.02 150.04 68.19 136.38 No Bid

Reducer, MJSEB x PE, 8" x 6" 2 100.31 200.62 97 194 77.49 154.98 70.94 141.88 No Bid

Reducer, MJLEB x PE, 4" x 3" 2 69.34 138.68 67 134 53.58 107.16 50.28 100.56 No Bid

Reducer, MJLEB x PE, 6" x 3" 2 93.05 186.1 90 180 71.89 143.78 71.55 143.1 No Bid

Reducer, MJLEB x PE, 6" x 4" 2 100.31 200.62 97 194 77.49 154.98 69.16 138.32 No Bid

Reducer, MJLEB x PE, 8" x 4" 2 120.06 240.12 119 238 95.16 190.32 74.97 149.94 No Bid

Reducer, MJLEB x PE, 8" x 6" 2 107.25 214.5 103 206 85.27 170.54 82.31 164.62 No Bid

Shoe, cleanout, 4" 10 51.03 510.3 57.75 577.5 46.91 469.1 59.14 591.4 No Bid

Valve box with lid, 18" x 24" 55 26.03 1431.65 32.35 1779.25 26.29 1445.95 41.94 2306.7 No Bid

Valve box with lid, 24" x 36" 20 36.45 729 47.75 955 37.63 752.6 59.14 1182.8 No Bid

Lid only, valve box 2 5.82 11.64 15 30 6.7 13.4 9.68 19.36 No Bid

Section 
5 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Section Continued on Next Page Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 



 Ring, manhole, 23.5" 4 77.07 308.28 97.5 390 106.91 427.64 97.89 391.56 No Bid

Cover, manhole w/city logo, 23.5" 2 108.01 216.02 125 250 112.65 225.3 103.16 206.32 No Bid

Ring and cover, manhole, 32" 10 267.13 2671.3 130 1300 264.39 2643.9 242.11 2421.1 No Bid

Plug, push-on, 4" 2 22.2 44.4 23.25 46.5 19.13 38.26 20.8 41.6 No Bid

Plug, push-on, 4" with 2" tap 2 31.16 62.32 31.5 63 26.06 52.12 29.2 58.4 No Bid

Plug, push-on, 6" 2 35.86 71.72 40 80 30.02 60.04 33.6 67.2 No Bid

Plug, Push-on, 6" with 2" tap 2 51.24 102.48 51 102 41.9 83.8 48 96 No Bid

Plug, push-on, 8" 2 49.1 98.2 49.65 99.3 40.91 81.82 46 92 No Bid

Plug, Push-on, 8" with 2" tap 2 63.62 127.24 64.35 128.7 52.12 104.24 59.6 119.2 No Bid

Manhole riser, concrete, 3" x 23 20 13.89 277.8 20 400 9.02 180.4 14.03 280.6 No Bid

Manhole riser, concrete, 3" x 32 20 17.22 344.4 23 460 11.19 223.8 19.68 393.6 No Bid

Hydralock for 5 1/4" opening 20 181.5 3630 205 4100 123.99 2479.8 156.84 3136.8 No Bid

T-bolt w/nuts (Corten), 3/4" x 4 1/2" 20 1.39 27.8 2.05 41 1.37 27.4 2.66 53.2 No Bid

Eye-bolt w/nuts, 3/4" x 4 1/2" 20 1.79 35.8 2.95 59 1.78 35.6 1.63 32.6 No Bid

All thread rods, 5/8", 10 ft long 10 7.7 77 15 150 9.79 97.9 10 100 No Bid

Nuts, 5/8" 30 0.18 5.4 0.75 22.5 0.3 9 0.32 9.6 No Bid

Stainless bolts, 5/8 x 3" 40 1.48 59.2 1.65 66 4.74 189.6 0.87 34.8 No Bid

Steel probing rod, 4' 10 17.48 174.8 25 250 21.89 218.9 23.16 231.6 No Bid

Manhold hook with flat handle, 24" 10 19.45 194.5 40 400 26.07 260.7 22.39 223.9 No Bid

Smith Blair Style 120 Quantit Unit Pric
Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Cam lock fitting f/MJPVC pipe, epoxy 
coated w/bolts, 4" 15 34.75 521.25 33.3 499.5 27.65 414.75 28.23 423.45 No Bid

Cam lock fitting f/MJPVC pipe, epoxy 
coated w/bolts, 6" 15 43.51 652.65 41.5 622.5 36.36 545.4 37.13 556.95 No Bid

Cam lock fitting f/MJPVC pipe, epoxy 
coated w/bolts, 8" 5 58.7 293.5 56.25 281.25 47.52 237.6 48.52 242.6 No Bid

Sub Total, All Items, Section 5 $25,112.31 $24,588.00 $20,941.78 $22,154.58 No Bid

Section 
6 Transition Couplings, POWERMAX Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Coupling, 3" PVC - 3" AC 2 64.54 129.08 75 150 67.4 134.8 69.21 138.42 No Bid

Coupling, 4" C900-3" AC 2 78.74 157.48 80 160 NA 84.45 168.9 No Bid

Coupling, 4" C900-4" AC 2 78.74 157.48 85 170 82.24 164.48 84.45 168.9 No Bid

Coupling, 6" C900-6" AC 2 111.03 222.06 90 180 115.96 231.92 119.07 238.14 No Bid

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Serampore, Ind.

South Houston

Hydra-Shield

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Westex

Westex

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

South Houston

East Jordan

East Jordan

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Serampore, Ind.

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Power Seal

Power Seal

Power Seal

Power Seal

Westex

Geo-Glen

Jones-StephensManufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Serampore, Ind.

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

MaxAdaptor

MaxAdaptor

MaxAdaptor

MaxAdaptor

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Sigma

Sigma

Sigma

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 

Smith-Blair

Smith-Blair

Smith-Blair

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 



Section 
6 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Coupling, 8" C900-8" AC 2 129.53 259.06 105 210 135.3 270.6 138.91 277.82 No Bid

Sub Total, All Items, Section 6 $925.16 $870.00 $801.80 $992.18

Section 
7 PVC Pipe and Fittings Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Pipe, C900, 4" x 20 40 2.14 1712 42.8 1712 1.96 1568 No Bid

Pipe, SCH 40, 1/2" 10 0.16 32 7.2 72 0.25 50 No Bid

Pipe, SCH 40, 3/4" 10 0.21 42 10 100 0.25 50 No Bid

Pipe, SCH 40, 1" 10 0.3 60 13.8 138 0.41 82 No Bid

Pipe, SCH 40, 2" 10 0.64 128 21 210 0.73 146 No Bid

Pipe, SCH 40, 4" x 20 80 1.74 2784 42 3360 2.09 3344 No Bid

Pipe, C900, 6" 20 4.26 1704 85.2 1704 3.87 1548 No Bid

Pipe, SCH 35, 6" x 14 40 1.92 1075.2 26.88 1075.2 1.74 974.4 No Bid

Pipe, C900, 8" 20 7.37 2948 147.4 2948 6.72 2688 No Bid

Pipe, 8" x 14 20 3.44 963.2 64.26 1285.2 3.12 873.6 No Bid

Adaptor, 1/2" PVC, female 20 0.16 3.2 0.22 4.4 0.15 3 3.43 68.6 No Bid

Adaptor, 3/4" PVC, female 20 0.2 4 0.25 5 0.19 3.8 3.99 79.8 No Bid

Adaptor, 1" PVC, female 20 0.23 4.6 0.3 6 0.22 4.4 4.62 92.4 No Bid

Adaptor, 1/2" PVC, male 20 0.13 2.6 0.2 4 0.12 2.4 2.71 54.2 No Bid

Adaptor, 3/4" PVC, male 20 0.14 2.8 0.21 4.2 0.13 2.6 3.01 60.2 No Bid

Adaptor, 1" PVC, male 20 0.24 4.8 0.35 7 0.24 4.8 5.42 108.4 No Bid

Reducer, 1 x 1/2 10 0.6 6 0.5 5 NA 0 3.93 39.3 No Bid

Reducer, 1 x 3/4 10 0.38 3.8 0.5 5 0.38 3.8 3.3 33 No Bid

Ell, 45 degree, 1/2" 20 0.23 4.6 0.45 9 0.22 4.4 5 100 No Bid

Ell, 45 degree, 3/4" 20 0.35 7 0.55 11 0.34 6.8 7.16 143.2 No Bid

Ell, 45 degree, 1" 20 0.42 8.4 0.65 13 0.41 8.2 8.57 171.4 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 1/2" 20 0.14 2.8 0.25 5 0.13 2.6 3.01 60.2 No Bid

Ell, 900 degree, 3/4" 20 0.16 3.2 0.28 5.6 0.15 3 3.43 68.6 No Bid

Ell, 90 degree, 1" 20 0.27 5.4 0.4 8 0.27 5.4 5.6 112 No Bid

Collar, PVC, 1/2" 20 0.1 2 0.15 3 0.09 1.8 1.95 39 No Bid

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Due to volatility of 
market this material 
can only be quoted as 
neededCharlotte/JM

Various

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Various

Section Continued on Next Page Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Power Seal

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Various

Various

Various

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Charlotte/JM

Charlotte/JM

Charlotte/JM

Charlotte/JM

MaxAdaptor

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 

Smith-Blair

Manufactu
rer (if 

other than 



Collar, PVC, 3/4" 20 0.13 2.6 0.2 4 0.12 2.4 2.71 54.2 No Bid

Collar, PVC, 1" 20 0.22 4.4 0.35 7 0.21 4.2 4.42 88.4 No Bid

Slip bushing, 1 x 1/2" 10 0.26 2.6 0.4 4 0.26 2.6 2.66 26.6 No Bid

Slip bushing, 1 x 3/4" 10 0.26 2.6 0.4 4 0.26 2.6 2.66 26.6 No Bid

Section 
7 Continued Quantit Unit Pric

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Sub Total, All Items, Section 7 $11,525.80 $12,718.60 $11,392.80 $1,426.10

Section Continued on Next Page

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Lasco/Spears

Manufacturer 
(if other than 

specified)

Manufacturer 
(if other than 
specified)



Coburn Supply
Core & Main 
LP CPR dba MDN

Accurate 
Utility Supply J&S Valve, Inc.

Section 1 $55,683.21 55952.90 62019.97 63288.50 No Bid

Section 2 No Bid 25054.78 25463.93 $21,993.00 No Bid

Section 3 $19,271.49

Did not bid all 
items in 
Section as 
Required 21750.02 22598.95 No Bid

Section 4 10902.34 10984.16 $9,996.73 10790 10,868.00

Section 5 25112.31 $20,941.78 22154.58 24588 No Bid

Section 6 925.16 $801.80 992.18 870 No Bid

Section 7 $11,525.80

Did not bid all 
items in 
Section as 
Required

Did not bid all 
items in 
Section as 
Required 12718.6 No Bid
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